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Case reports
Case 1

Fig. 1. Case 1.

A male 60 years old, hailing from Debidwar, 
Comilla, presented to the outpatient 
department of National Institute of 
Ophthalmology and Hospital (NIOH), Dhaka 
with the complaints of gradually increasing 
painless swelling on the left upper eyelid for 
2 years (Fig. 1). On examination, the lesion 
was 6 cm x 5 cm in diameters and firm in 
consistency. On fine-needle aspiration 
(FNA), some whitish material came out. 
Then histopathology (Fig. 2) and 
immunohistochemistry (Fig. 3) were done 
and the results were in support of the 
diagnosis NHL of B-cell origin. All other 
relevant investigations were done including 
complete blood count (CBC), bleeding time 
(BT), clotting time (CT), and random blood 
sugar (RBS), electrocardiography (ECG), 
chest X-ray posteroanterior (P/A) view and 
were found to be unremarkable. 

Fig. 2. Histopathology from the sample of 
the Case 1. A. Photomicrograph showing  
the monomorphous population of atypical 
lymphoid cells, scanty cytoplasm with 
clumped chromatin. (PAP,  x200). B. Photo-
micrograph showing the hypercellular prolif-
erations. Most of the tumor cells are monoto-
nous in appearance, having large nuclei with 
condensed chromatin. (H&E, x400).
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Case 2

Fig. 4. Case 2.

A male aged 35 years from Muladi, Barisal 
presented with gradually increasing mass on 
both the upper eyelids for six months (Fig. 
4). He presented to the outpatient depart-
ment of NIOH, Dhaka. The tumor was firm in 
consistency. FNA, histopathology (Fig. 5) 
and immunohistochemistry (Fig. 6) were 
done and were done and the results were in 
support of the diagnosis NHL of B-cell origin.
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Fig. 5. Histopathology from the sample of 
the Case 2. A. Photomicrograph showing the 
monomorphous population of atypical 
lymphoid cells, scanty cytoplasm with 
clumped chromatin. (PAP, x200). B. Photo-
micrograph showing the hypercellular prolif-
erations. Most of the tumor cells are monoto-
nous in appearance, having large nuclei with 
condensed chromatin. (H&E, x200).

Fig. 3. Immunostaining from the sample 
of the Case 1. A. Photomicrograph of immu-
nohistochemistry study showing lymphoid 
cells with positive staining for the leukocyte 
common antigen. (IHC, x400). B. Photomi-
crograph of immunohistochemistry study 
showing scattered lymphoid cells with posi-
tive staining for CD3. (IHC, x400). C. Photo-
micrograph of immunohistochemistry study 
showing  the majority of atypical lymphoid 
cells with positive staining for CD20. (IHC, 
x400).
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Other relevant investigations including CBC, 
BT, CT, RBS, and chest X-ray P/A view were 
within normal limit.
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having mean ages in the seventh decade of 
life. The median age at presentation for 
orbital and adnexal lymphoma is older than 
60 years. In a study conducted in the United 
States, malignant lymphoma was the most 
common orbital tumor in the elderly age 
group, accounting for 24.0% of cases.14  But 
in the present study, one aged 35 years and 
the other 60 years old. These cases were in 
younger age comparative to the mentioned 
study. 

On initial presentation, orbital adnexal 
lymphoma is either unilateral or bilateral, but 
ultimately, 80.0-90.0% of patients had bilat-
eral involvement.15-18 In our study one had 
unilateral and the other had bilateral.

Cytological feature
Smears show a monomorphous population 
of atypical lymphoid cells, scanty cytoplasm 
with clumped chromatin.19 

Histological features
Hypercellular proliferations are seen with 
sparse stroma.20

Immunohistochemistry
Immunological identification of cell surface 
markers on lymphocytes can be used to 
classify tumors as containing T- or B-cells 
and as being monoclonal or polyclonal in 
origin. The vast majority of orbital lympho-
mas are of B-cell origin with monoclonal 
proliferation from a single neoplastic cell.21

Treatment
As for other extranodal forms of lymphoma, 
the treatment of ocular adnexal lymphoma 
depends on the stage and histological classi-
fication. For isolated ocular adnexal 
lymphoma (stage IE) of low grade, external-
beam radiation therapy is considered the 
standard therapy.22 For more widespread 
disease or for higher-grade lymphomas, 
systemic chemotherapy or a combination of 
chemotherapy and radiation therapy may be 
more appropriate.23 Another alternative for 
stage IE low-grade lymphoma of the ocular 
adnexa, particularly low-grade B-cell follicu-
lar lymphoma or mucosa-associated 
lymphoid tissue lymphoma, may be monoclo-
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Discussion
The incidence of lymphoproliferative ocular 
diseases, especially malignant lymphoma, 
has increased over the years. Lymphoma is 
the most common primary malignant orbital 
tumor in Asian countries like Japan and 
Korea.9-11

As well as in Europe, the incidence of ocular 
lymphoma increases with advancing 
age.12,13 Intraocular lymphoma typically 
affects elderly patients, with reported series
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Fig. 6. Immunostaining from the sample 
of the Case 2. A. Photomicrograph of immu-
nohistochemistry study showing scattered 
lymphoid cells with positive staining for CD3. 
(IHC, x400). B. Photomicrograph of immuno-
histochemistry study showing  majority of 
atypical  lymphoid cells with positive staining 
for CD20. (IHC, x400). C. Photomicrograph 
of immunohistochemistry study showing 
lymphoid cells with positive staining for 
leukocyte common antigen. (IHC, x400).
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nal antibody therapy.24

The incidence of malignant lymphoma was 
25.0% (3 of 12 malignant tumors). The ratio 
seemed to be higher comparing to previous 
reports as 2.6-18.3%.25 In the present study, 
2 (2.4%, out of 85) cases were cytopatho-
logically and histopathologically diagnosed 
as NHL and immunohistochemically 
confirmed as NHL B-cell origin. It revealed 
lymphoid cells showing positive staining for 
leukocyte common antigen, scattered 
lymphoid cells positive staining for CD3 and 
majority of the atypical lymphoid cells show-
ing positive staining for CD20.

Conclusion
The rate of lymphoma is increasing world-
wide. In Bangladesh, it is detected frequently 
due to improved facilities. It is an alarming 
scenario. So, we should be alert. Early detec-
tion will save and/or prolong patients’ life.
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