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Case report
A 28-years-old lady, para-2 (caesarian 
section) + 1 (abortion) was admitted to Gazi 
Medical College Hospital at her 8 weeks of 
gestation with lower abdominal pain on 9th 
October 2016. On clinical examination, a 
mobile, non-tender, regular, cystic masse 
measuring about 12×9 cm found on left side 
of lower abdomen. On ultrasound a large 
(12.5 × 9 cm), solitary, unilocular cyst was 
detected on left adnexa. The patient had an 
ultrasound report of 2 weeks back which 
indicated that the mass was very rapidly 
growing. So the patient was advised for 
laparotomy. She was also counseled about 
the teratogenic effect of all drugs used 
during anesthesia and also risk of abortion 
after operation. She wished to do termina-
tion of pregnancy by dilatation and evacua-
tion and curettage (D&E&C) after lapa-
rotomy at the same sitting. So, after taking 
consent laparotomy followed by left sided 
oophorectomy and D&E&C was done on 9th 
October 2016. On macroscopic examination, 
the cyst was 15 cm in diameter & maximum 
wall thickness was 1.3 cm; both the outer 
and inner surfaces were smooth and regu-
lar. Microscopically, the inner surface was 
lined by a single or multiple layers of 
profoundly luteinized cells with granulosa 
cell layer. The epithelium had shed in some 
parts of the wall, preserving a zone of 
fibrous stroma. The pathological diagnosis 
was a large single luteinized follicular cyst of 
pregnancy (Fig. 1).

Discussion
Ovarian tumors and tumor like masses 
during pregnancy are uncommon. Most neo-
plasms are benign, and about 4.0% are 
malignant. Tumor-like lesions include preg-
nancy luteoma, hyperreactioluteinalis, intra 
follicular granulosa cell proliferation; hilus 
cell hyperplasia, ectopic decidua and large 
solitary luteinized follicle cyst of pregnancy 
(LSLFCP). LSLFCP is a benign tumor. It is 
of particular interest because of its enor-
mous size and confusion with neoplasms. 
LSLFCP is a rare lesion; only about 8 cases 
have been reported in the literature previ-
ously. The pathogenesis of LSLFCPP is 
unclear. Its occurrence during pregnancy

Fig. 1. Microscopic picture of large lutein-
ized follicular cyst of pregnancy.  A, low 
power (4x) view; B, medium power (10x) 
view; C, high power (40x) view.
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terized by the combination of a benign 
appearance and a tendency to enlarge 
rapidly, eventually becoming symptomatic 
and most often necessitating surgery.
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suggests a role of human chorionic gonado-
tropin (hCG). Here no hCG level is 
estimated. Although lined by luteinized cells, 
the cyst is unlikely to originate from a corpus 
luteum. The major differential diagnoses 
include the unilocular cystic granulose cell 
tumors of both the adult and juvenile types. 

Although LSLFCP is in distinguishable 
grossly from unilocular cystic granulosa 
tumors, they differ in microscopic features. 
Unlike LSLFCP that show luteinized cells 
with focal bizarre nuclei, adult granulosa cell 
tumor is composed of a monotonous popula-
tion of granulosa cells usually without luteini-
sation and bizarre nuclei. Furthermore, 
nuclear grooves and Call-Exner bodies are 
seen in granulosa cell tumor but not in 
LSLFCP. Juvenile granulosa cell tumor is 
mitotically active while LSLFCP shows 
absent to occasional mitotic figures.9 

Another differential diagnosis is a growing 
simple cyst. These simple cysts are charac-
terized by the combination of a benign 
appearance and a tendency to enlarge 
rapidly, eventually becoming symptomatic 
and most often necessitating surgery.

As with any adnexal tumor, the management 
options include either follow-up of the patient 
or surgical removal. Data from series in preg-
nancy indicate that the risk for torsion in 
cysts 6-8 cm in diameter is 22.0%7; and, one 
in nine cysts of more than 5 cm will require 
surgery and this rate increases to 45.0% for 
symptomatic cysts.10 Although published 
data are limited specifically in case of large 
luteinized cysts of pregnancy, their tendency 
to rapid grow means that they are associated 
with higher risk, and removal was finally 
required, either before delivery.10-12

Conclusion
In conclusion, large luteinized follicular cysts 
of pregnancy are an uncommon type of 
cystic mass particular to pregnancy, which 
should be included in the differential diag-
nostic workup whenever unilocular cystic 
granulosa cell tumors of both the adult and 
juvenile types, and a growing simple cyst is 
encountered. These simple cysts are charac-
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